




3D Fiberglass Heart

 2D Dibond Heart

Pots Gianto - Customizable

Selfie Photo Frame

2D Openwork Hearts - Full/Frame

3D Openwork Hearts - Half

Discover our SPECIAL

PRODUCTS...
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Organize events such as concerts, Valentine’s fairs, 
or art workshops featuring thematic decorations.

Brand’s Terra Group

HOTELS  
Transform your hotel into a haven of 
romance with Valentine’s Day  
decorations that enchant your guests 
and make their stay unforgettable.
  
URBAN SPACES 
Create a charming, romantic ambi-
ance in urban areas with Valentine’s 
Day-themed decorations that capti-
vate both residents and visitors.

PHOTO CORNERS 
Design unique photo zones with our 
stunning Valentine’s Day decorations. 
The Selfie Frame is the perfect addi-
tion for capturing memorable mo-
ments.

LAMP POST DECORATIONS 
Elevate the charm of your streets with 
beautifully adorned lamp posts featur-
ing openwork hearts. Pair them with 
stylish planters filled with plants and 
heart-shaped accents for a cohesive 
look. 
 
3D HEARTS 
Make a statement with a striking 
fiberglass heart installation. Alterna-
tively, opt for an artistic arrangement 
of openwork hearts that is sure to 
capture attention and become a social 
media sensation.

Decorations from Terra Group 

”
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2D HEART DIBOND
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CUSTOMIZABLE

1. 2. 3.



3D HEART OPENWORK
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2D OPENWORK HEART
FULL/FRAME

2 x HALF



HEART 3D  
FIBERGLASS

SELFIE PHOTO FRAME
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CUSTOMIZABLE



POTS POLYETHYLENE
CUSTOMIZABLE
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